Bhanumurali A. T (VD)

As our the discussion we are sending we have given our final price for the same

Annamalai palaniappan <annamalai.palaniappan@aapl.co.in>

22 October 2024 17:08
Bhanumurali A. T (VD)
Suresh SR

Re: QUOTATION REQIRED FOR GLASS EDGE SHINE&STILE PLUS

as peryour drawing
as per your drawing
as peryour drawing
as peryour drawing

From:
Sent:
To:
Ce:
Subject:
Dear Sir,
1. GS0809 3B
2. GSe810 2B
3. GS0809 3B
4. GSe869 3B
Awaiting for your valuable order
Delivery at your factory
MOQ 1000 nos per model

Payment terms 30 day from the billing date.
)

Nle. Shonke- Enderproe tut Ld,
From: Annamalai palaniappan <annamalai.palaniappan@aapl.co.in>
‘Sent: Monday, October 14, 2024 7:35 AM
To: Bhanumurali A. T (VD) <bhanumurali.a@mayaappliances.com>

Cc: Suresh S R <suresh.sr@mayaappliances.com>
Subject: Re: QUOTATION REQIRED FOR GLASS EDGE SHINE&STILE PLUS

Dear Sir,

We are glad to know that the samples we have given you have passed all parameters of your

Rs 541
Rs 455
Rs 361
Rs 477

CM-GS6809-AB
cM-GS0S|o-A B
M -GS OCISE-HA
CN-LSOSS-P R

requirements. We have given our best quote below for your all 4 models. Assuring you our best service in

quality and the delivery time

GS0809 3B
GS0810 2B
GS0809 3B
GS0809 3B

el el S

as peryour drawing
as peryour drawing
as peryour drawing
as peryour drawing

Delivery at your factory

MOQ 1000 nos per model

Payment terms 30 day from the billing date.

Awaiting for your valuable order.

P.Annamalai
Managing Director
SEPL

Rs 543
Rs 457
Rs 362
Rs 492



