Bhanumurali A. T (VD)

From: NITIN GARG <nitin2951980@yahoo.com>

Sent: 30 September 2024 18:32

To: meghatech183@gmail.co; Bhanumurali A. T (VD)
Cc: Suresh S R; Purchase

Subject: Re: GAS FLOW PIPE VIVA PRO REAR INLET NEW
Dear sir,

please, rate will be rupees 45.50 our best price sir.

SR NO. CODE ITEM NAME PRICE
GAS FLOW PIPE VIVA PRO REAR INLET i
1 | CM-GS1469-AA | NEW — 980mm \org 45.55 | 4550
v/ 5

Eﬁc(i,b%'\'vﬁ 5L ps &iq&‘f'\lo_p\u rogBmW\\wj - 5150
Thanks,

Regards,
Megha Tech

On Monday, September 30, 2024 at 11:22:50 AM GMT+5:30, Bhanumurali A. T (VD)
<bhanumurali.a@mayaappliances.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Further to trailing mail, updated drawing for Gas Flow Pipe VIVA Pro Rear inlet attached.
Please send us your quotation immediately to release the P.O.

Regards

A.T. Bhanumurali

From: Bhanumurali A. T (VD)
Sent: 27 September 2024 18:44
To: nitin2951980@yahoo.com; meghatech183@gmail.co



