Murugan - Purchase : i =

From: Vimalendiran eSV connect <vimal@esvconnects.com>
Sent: Monday,July, 29,2024 11:50 AM

To: Murugan - Purchase

Cc: kumar@esvconnects.com; ‘Quality’

Subject: RE: 1sg.mm Power Chord Drawing

Dear Mr. Murugan

X'e have gone through your drawing and with current LME and PVC price , we are able to support the price of Rs.
85.85+GST ( delivered)

Please consider our request and confirm for us to proceed further.
Thanks . NS
¥ \1'\“‘l \

Vimal

From: Murugan - Purchase [mailto:murugan.k@mayaappliances.com] - k.
Sent: 29 July 2024 09:40 LT N

To: vimal ‘Q ik UJ‘JUL

Cc: kumar@esvconnects.com
Subject: 1sq.mm Power Chord Drawing

Dear Sir,

Please find attached the power chord drawing for your reference.

Our Final price for the above drawing is Rs. 80 /- and the MOQ is 1000 nos.
Please give your confirmation to release the order.

Regards,

Murugan K



